

UNAUDITED COPY
SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
BID # 19-59 SCHOOL NUTRITION PROGRAM – CLEANING SUPPLIES (ANNUAL CONTRACT)

BID OPENING DATE & TIME: June 6, 2019 @ 11:00 AM

PRE-BID DATE/LOCATION: N/A

Note: 2 addenda were issued on this project

BIDDERS	Docs Signed (Y/N)	Addendum(s) Acknowledged (Y/N)	LMWBE Status	Item 1 Heavy Duty Pot and Pan Detergent 5-gallon Qty – 250	Item 2 Sanitizer for Pots and Pans 1-gallon Qty – 250	Item 3 Drain Maintenance Cleaner 4-gallon Qty - 50	Item 4 Degreasing Detergent 1-gallon Qty - 250	Item 5 Dispensers and Spray Bottles
1. Ecolab, Inc. 1 Ecolab Place, EGH-7 St. Paul, MN 55102 651-250-4358 (Phone) 651-306-5429 (FAX)	Y	Y, 1 and 2	N	\$65.33/5 Gallon #6112971 \$65.33/1-5 gal \$16,332.50	\$16.3325/1 Gallon #6117781 \$65.33/4-1 gal \$4,083.13	\$47.552/1 Gallon #6129810 \$118.88/1-2.5 gal \$9,510.40	\$10.34/1 Gallon #6119513 \$41.36/4-1 gal \$2,585.00	No Charge
2. SFSPac 400 N. Ashland Avenue Chicago, IL 60622-6382 NO BID								
3. Unipak Corp P.O. Box 300027 Brooklyn, NY 11230 NO BID								

BIDDERS	Item 6 Multi-Purpose Cleaner for Windows for Serving Lines 1-gallon Qty - 150	Item 7 Liquid Hand Soap with Dispenser Case Qty – 150	Item 8 Elbow-length Pot and Pan Gloves	Item 9 Flexible Gloves	Item 10 Dry Rinse Agent 4-gallon Qty - 25	Item 11 Peroxide Multi-Surface Cleaner 2.5 gallon Qty – 50	Item 12 Oven Scrapers
1. Ecolab, Inc.	\$68.484/1 Gallon #6100302 \$171.21/1-2.5 gal \$10,272.60	\$75.32/6–750 ml cs #6101089 \$75.32/6-750 ml \$11,298.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$17.5875/1 Gallon #6111817 \$70.35/4-1 gal \$1,758.75	\$33.535/1 Gallon #6100693 \$67.07/1-2 gal \$4,191.88	NO BID

BIDDERS	Item 13 Googles	Item 14 Laundry Detergent Pail Qty – 25	Item 15 Soap Solid Powder Each Qty – 50	Item 16 Bathroom Cleaner 1 gallon Qty – 100	Item 17 Oven Cleaner 6/32 oz case Qty – 25	Item 18 Stainles Steel Cleaner 12/17 oz case Qty – 50	Item 19 Lime Away Descaler 4-gallon Qty – 150
1. Ecolab, Inc.	NO BID	\$1.582/1 Lb #6110391 \$71.17/1-45 lb \$1,779.25	\$24.32/9 lb Solid Capsule #6100185 \$97.28/4-9 lb \$1,216.00	\$25.624/1 Gallon #6100275 \$64.06/1-2.5 gal \$2,562.40	\$37.77/6 32 oz cs #6129777 \$37.77/6 32 oz. \$944.25	\$48.94/12 17 oz cs #6100467 \$48.94/12-17 oz. \$2,447.00	\$7.09/1 Gallon #6101131 \$28.36/4-1 gal \$4,254.00

BIDDERS	Item 20 Floor Cleaner 2.5 gallon Qty – 150	Item 21 Quat Sanitizer Test Strips	Item 22 Freezer/Cooler Floor Cleaner 4/1 gallon Qty – 150	Item 23 Combi Cleaner 4 gallon Qty - 50	Item 24 Combi Rinse 4 gallon Qty – 50	Delivery	Total Bid
1. Ecolab, Inc.	\$31.652/1 Gallon #6100731 \$79.13/1-2.5 gal \$11,869.50	NO BID	\$16.02/1 Gallon #6115461 \$64.08/4-1 gal \$9,612.00	\$16.036/1 Gallon #6100704 \$40.09/1-2.5 gal \$3,207.20	\$10.916/1 Gallon #6100704 \$27.29/1-2.5 gal \$2,183.20	5 Days	\$100,107.06

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Teresa Jayne Phillips CERTIFIED BY: Joan Carter

NUMBER OF ITBs MAILED:	<u> 18 </u>	TO LMWBE	<u> 7 </u>	A	<u> 4 </u>	W	<u> 3 </u>	H	<u> </u>	S	<u> </u>	I	<u> </u>	L	<u> </u>	N	<u> </u>	M	<u> </u>
NUMBER NOTIFIED BY GPR:	<u> 8 </u>	TO LMWBE	<u> 1 </u>	A	<u> 1 </u>	AA	<u> </u>	NA	<u> </u>	H	<u> </u>	PI/A	<u> </u>	M	<u> </u>	NC	<u> </u>		<u> </u>
NUMBER OF RFPS RECEIVED:	<u> 1 </u>	FROM LMWBE:	<u> 0 </u>	A	<u> </u>	W	<u> </u>	H	<u> </u>	S	<u> </u>	I	<u> </u>	L	<u> </u>	N	<u> </u>	M	<u> </u>

KEY: DISTRICT MINORITY DESIGNATIONS:
A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W=WOMAN, H=HISPANIC, S=ASIAN AMERICAN, I=AMERICAN INDIAN, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL, M=MAJORITY

KEY: GPR MINORITY DESIGNATIONS:
A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, AA=ASIAN AMERICAN, NA=NATIVE AMERICAN, H=HISPANIC/LATINO, PI/A= PACIFIC ISLAND/AMERICAN, M =NON-MINORITY, NC=NOT CLASSIFIED