

School Nutrition Program – Disposables (Annual Contract)
Number: Bid 19-14
Addendum #1

The information contained in this document shall become an official part of the original document and shall be acknowledged as noted on the Certification Form and the Bid Form of the solicitation document in the space provided. Failure to acknowledge receipt of an addendum may result in a status of non-responsive. Firms are encouraged to review the contents of this document and to respond accordingly.

Addendum No. 1 is being issued to answer questions submitted prior to the deadline for Request for Interpretations and to provide Attachment E (attached).

Q1. Is this awarded to one vendor or on a line item basis?

Answer: The contract will be awarded to one vendor.

Q2. Approximately how many delivery locations are there?

Answer: See Attachment E.

Q3. For line item 9, is this ordered "as needed"?

Answer: Item 9 is for daily use and is ordered on an "as needed" basis.

Q4. For line item 9, is the requested amount 10,000 cases or 10,000 liners?

Answer: 10,000 cases.

Q5. Could you please provide us with the previous award tabulation?

Answer: Yes. See previous bid tabulation for Bid 14-06 SNP – Disposables (Annual Contract) attached.

Q6. Please advise if a bidder must bid on all items on the above referenced bid, in order to be considered for award.

Answer: Yes, the contract will be awarded to one vendor.

ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS REMAIN UNCHANGED

END OF ADDENDUM NO. 1

**BOARD OF PUBLIC EDUCATION FOR THE CITY OF SAVANNAH AND THE COUNTY OF CHATHAM
ITB # 19-14 ATTACHMENT E**

SCHOOL NUTRITION CAFETERIA DIRECTORY		
Bartlett Middle 207 East Montgomery Cross Road Savannah, GA 31406	Largo-Tibet Elementary 430 Tibet Avenue Savannah, GA 31406	Gould Elementary 4910 Pineland Drive Savannah, GA 31405
Brock Elementary 1804 Stratford Street Savannah, GA 31401	School of Humanities at Juliette Low Elementary 15 Blueridge Avenue Savannah, GA 31404	Groves High 100 Priscilla D. Thomas Way Savannah, GA 31408
Beach High 3001 Hopkins Street Savannah, GA 31405	Marshpoint Elementary 135 Whitemarsh Island Road Savannah, GA 31410	Haven Elementary 5111 Dillon Avenue Savannah, GA 31405
Bloomingtondale Elementary 101 E. Main Street Bloomingtondale, GA 31302	Mercer Middle 201 Rommel Avenue Savannah, GA 31408	Heard Elementary 414 Lee Boulevard Savannah, GA 31405
Butler Elementary 1909 Cynthia Street Savannah, GA 31415	Myers Middle 2025 East 52 nd Street Savannah, GA 31404	Hesse K-8 School 9116 Whitfield Avenue Savannah, GA 31406
Coastal Middle 4595 US Hwy 80 Road Savannah, GA 31410	New Hampstead High School 2451 Little Neck Road Savannah, GA 31302	Hodge Elementary 975 Clinch Street Savannah, GA 31405
DeRenne Middle 1009 Clinch Street Savannah, GA, 31405	Oglethorpe Charter School 7202 Central Avenue Savannah, GA 31406	Howard Elementary 115 Wilmington Island Road Savannah, GA 31410
East Broad K- 8 400 E. Broad Street Savannah, GA 31401	Pooler Elementary 308 Holly Avenue Pooler, GA 31322	Hubert Middle 768 Grant Street Savannah, GA 31401
Ellis Elementary Montessori (K-8) 220 E. 49th Street Savannah, GA 31405	Port Wentworth Elementary E.S. K-2 507 South Coastal Highway Port Wentworth, GA 31407	Islands High School 170 Whitemarsh Island Road Savannah, GA 31410
Gadsden Elementary 919 May Street Savannah, GA 31401	Pulaski Elementary 1001 Tibet Avenue Savannah, GA 31419	Isle Of Hope Elementary 100 Parkersburg RD Savannah, GA 31406
Garden City Elementary 4037 Kessler Avenue Savannah, GA 31408	Rice Creek 3-8 School 100 Mulberry Avenue Port Wentworth, GA 31407	Jenkins High 1800 DeRenne Avenue Savannah, GA 31406
Garrison School for the Arts K- 8 649 West Jones Street Savannah, GA 31401	Savannah Arts Academy 500 WASHINGTON AVE Savannah, GA 31405	Johnson High 3012 Sunset Boulevard Savannah, GA 31404
Georgetown K-8 1516 King George Boulevard Savannah, GA 31419	Savannah High and Early College 400 Pennsylvania Avenue Savannah, GA 31404	Jacob G. Smith Elementary 210 Lamara Avenue Savannah, GA 31405
Godley Station 2135 Benton Boulevard Savannah, GA 31407	Shuman Elementary 415 Goebel Avenue Savannah, GA 31404	Southwest Elementary 6020 Ogeechee Road Savannah, GA 31419

SCHOOL NUTRITION CAFETERIA DIRECTORY

Southwest Middle 6030 Ogeechee Road Savannah, GA 31419	Andrea B. Williams Elementary 1150 Wheaton Street Savannah, GA 31404	West Chatham Elementary 820 Pine Barren Road Pooler, GA 31322
West Chatham Middle 800 Pine Barren Road Pooler, GA 31322	White Bluff Elementary 5330 Montgomery Street Savannah, GA 31406	Windsor Elementary 414 Briarcliff Circle Savannah, GA 31419
Windsor High 12419 Largo Drive Savannah, GA 31419	Woodville/Tompkins High 151 Coach Joe Turner Drive Savannah, GA 31408	

***Number of delivery sites and delivery site addresses are subject to change due to the needs of the district.**

BID #14-06 SNP- DISPOSABLES (ANNUAL CONTRACT)

BID 14-06 SNP- DISPOSABLES (ANNUAL CONTRACT)

Bidder: Southeastern Paper Group
 Spartanburg, South Carolina
 U/M/WBE: Not Stated
 All American Poly
 Piscataway, New Jersey
 Not Stated
 Williams Institutional Foo
 Douglas, Georgia

ITEM:	DESCRIPTION:	UOM:	QTY:	UNIT COST:	TOTAL:	UNIT COST:	TOTAL:	UNIT COST:	TOTAL:
1	Aprons, Disposable	100/Case	150	\$3.80	\$570.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
2	Aluminum Foil	500/Roll	250	\$19.84	\$4,960.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
3	Can Liners, 10-13 Gallon	1,000/Case	50	\$17.99	\$899.50	\$22.76	\$1,138.00	No Bid	N/A
4	Can Liners, 45 Gallon	100/Case	10000	\$17.99	\$179,900.00	\$13.72	\$137,200.00	No Bid	N/A
5	Sandwich Bags #18	2,000/Case	200	\$11.90	\$2,380.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
6	Bags, 5" x 8"	1,000/Case	75	\$13.80	\$1,035.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
7	Bags, 18" x 24"	250/Case	250	\$11.00	\$2,750.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
8	Bags, 27" x 32"	200/Case	250	\$14.83	\$3,707.50		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
9	Bags, 13" x 15"	1,000/Case	250	\$13.67	\$3,417.50		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
10	Bags, School Lunch 6#	2,000/Case	250	\$54.96	\$13,740.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
11	Bags, Wax 6" x 7"	2,000/Case	10	\$11.89	\$118.90		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
12	Bowls, Foam; 10 oz.	1,000/Case	700	\$33.87	\$23,709.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
13	Lids, Bowl; 10 oz.	1,000/Case	150	\$39.80	\$5,970.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
14	Bowls, Foam; 6 oz.	2,000/Case	2000	\$29.24	\$58,480.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
15	Bowls, Foam; 12 oz.	1,000/Case	25	\$28.97	\$724.25		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
16	Bowls, Plastic; 5 oz.	2,500/Case	1500	\$21.52	\$32,280.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
17	Salad Containers, Chef	250/Case	300	\$29.93	\$8,979.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
18	Cups, Clear- 12 oz.	500/Case	10	\$55.00	\$550.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
19	Lids, Dome Cup- 12 oz.	1,000/Case	10	\$47.53	\$475.30		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
20	Cups, Foam- 16 oz.	1,000/Case	20	\$36.92	\$738.40		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
21	Lids, 16 oz.	1,000/Case	10	\$14.66	\$146.60		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
22	Straw	1,200/Case	10	\$34.51	\$345.10		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
23	Cups, Souffle- 2 oz.	2,500/Case	100	\$23.00	\$2,300.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
24	Lids, Souffle- 2 oz.	2,500/Case	75	\$23.50	\$1,762.50		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
25	Cups, Souffle- 5 oz.	2,500/Case	500	\$22.57	\$11,285.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
26	Fork Kit (6" Form w/napkin)	1,000/Case	3500	\$7.98	\$27,930.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
27	Foil Sheets	2,500/Case	150	\$63.20	\$9,480.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
28	Gloves, Small	1,000/Case	20	\$21.42	\$428.40		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
29	Gloves, Medium	1,000/Case	150	\$21.42	\$3,213.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
30	Gloves, Large	1,000/Case	550	\$21.42	\$11,781.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
31	Gloves, Medium Poly	1,000/Case	20	\$8.20	\$164.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
32	Gloves, Large; Poly	1,000/Case	20	\$8.20	\$164.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
33	Hairnets, X-Large	144/Box	200	\$11.50	\$2,300.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
34	Napkins, 1/4 Fold	6,000/Case	300	\$46.95	\$14,085.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A

BID #14-06 SNP-DISPOSABLES (ANNUAL CONTRACT)

35	Dispenser, Napkin	Each	15	\$5.00	\$75.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
36	Plates, Foam- 6"	1,000/Case	15	\$25.82	\$387.30		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
37	Paper Towels, Brown-Multifold	4,000/Case	200	\$16.95	\$3,390.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
38	Dispenser, Paper Towel	Each	5	\$25.00	\$125.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
39	Pad, Scouring- Scotch Brite Purple	24/Case	50	\$16.90	\$845.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
40	Rack Cover, Bun	50/Case	300	\$13.50	\$4,050.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
41	Wax Paper, Interfolded	6,000/Case	225	\$55.00	\$12,375.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
42	Spoons, Soup- 6"	1,000/Case	2500	\$8.40	\$21,000.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
43	Wipes, Sanitizing (? Wipes/Tub)	6 Tubs/Case	2500	\$49.70	\$124,250.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
44	Toilet Tissue, 2-Ply (?Sheets/Roll)	96 Rolls/Case	1000	\$31.00	\$31,000.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
45	Trays, Food- #500	1,000/Case	7000	\$18.79	\$131,530.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
46	Trays, 5-Compartment- Foam	1,000/Case	8,100	\$17.80	\$144,180.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
47	Trays, 3-Compartment- Foam	150/Case	250	\$14.88	\$3,720.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
48	Food Wrap, Clear 18" x 2,000'	Per Roll	300	\$17.50	\$5,250.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
49	Towlette, Moist- Lemon Scent	1,000/Case	2700	\$8.90	\$24,030.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
50	Test Strips,	150/Vial	50	\$6.95	\$347.50		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
51	Spray Bottle, 32 Oz.	Each	50	\$0.67	\$33.50		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
52	Pan Liner, 16-1/2" x 24-1/2"	1,000/Case	350	\$29.90	\$10,465.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
53	Bags, Clear 8" x 3" x 15"	2,000/Case	20	\$13.67	\$273.40		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
54	Cups, Souffle, 2 oz.- Paper	5,000/Case	50	\$52.50	\$2,625.00		\$0.00	No Bid	N/A
					\$950,720.65		\$138,338.00		

Certified By: Margaret Disher, Lead Buyer

