



**AUDITED  
SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION  
LAMINATORS AND ROLL FILM  
BID #19-08**

BIDDERS	Item # 9 Heat Seal Ultima 65 Laminator (GBC 1710740)	Item # 10 Ultima 65 Laminator Cabinet	Item #11 Ultima 65 Roller Cleaning Kit (GBC 1528744)	Item #12 Full Circle Service for the Heat Seal Ultima 65 Laminator 1 <sup>st</sup> yr 2 <sup>nd</sup> yr 3 <sup>rd</sup> yr	Item #13 25" x 500' 1.5 mil Nap Lam I (GBC 3000004) per box (of 2)	Item #14 27" x 500' 1.5 mil Nap Lam I (GBC 3126061) per box (of 2)	Item #15 Service for Laminators  Service Calls Labor Parts	Delivery	Total Bid Price
1. G2 Technologies dba Paper Handling Solutions	\$1,932.50 As spec	\$668.00 As spec	\$100.00 As spec	\$1,200.00	\$27.50 (per roll)	\$35.71 (per roll)	\$30,000.00	28 - 42 days	\$47,567.71
2. ACCO Brands USA LLC	\$1,425.00 ACCO Brand; Brands GBC Model: 1710740B	\$688.00 ACCO Brand; Brands GBC Model: 1154314	\$65.94 ACCO Brand; Brands GBC Model: 1711515	Y-1 \$363.00 Y-2 \$689.70 Y-3 \$1,001.88	\$36.30 (per box)	\$52.00 (per box)	Service \$150.00 One-time trip - \$49.00 Parts price varies	Within 5 days	\$17,967.44
3. Pyramid School Products	\$1,509.95 GBC, Model: 1710740	\$779.98 GBC, Model: 1154314	No bid	No bid	\$19.79 (per roll)	\$26.75 (per roll)	No bid	7-10 days	\$6,341.35
4. Quill Corporation 100 Schelter Road Lincolnshire, IL 60069 No Bid									
5. DGS Educational Products 4101 Linton Blvd, Unit 11A-650 Delray Beach, FL 33445 No Bid									
Previous Contract Award Bid 15-72 ACCO Brands USA, LLC dba GBC									

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Kathleen Watson-Scott, Purchasing Agent *Kathleen Scott* CERTIFIED BY: Alicia White, Purchasing Agent *Alicia White*  
 NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 10 TO LMWBE:    A    W    H    M    L    N 3 S    I     
 NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 3 FROM LMWBE:    A    W    H    M    L    N    S    I   

KEY TO MINORITY DESIGNATIONS: A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W= WOMAN, H= HISPANIC, M=MAJORITY, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL