

Savannah/Chatham County Public School System

Bid 18-13

Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening Date & Time: August 3, 2017 @ 11:00 AM

Note: No addendum was issued on this project

Item #		ISBN #	Textbook Warehouse Price	Superior Text Price	Follett School Solutions, Inc. Price	Cengage Learning, Inc. Price
1	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. K	9780544338487	2044.04	2565.63	No Bid	No Bid
2	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 1	9780544338371	2028.15	2565.63	803.20	No Bid
3	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 2	9780544338388	1159.25	1454.89	459.02	No Bid
4	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 3	9780544338432	1542.05	1935.45	No Bid	No Bid
5	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 4	9780544338456	1075.70	1320.27	416.55	No Bid
6	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 5	9780544338470	1075.70	1320.27	No Bid	No Bid
7	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 1, 2006	9780618497850	19.85	30.00	21.79	No Bid
8	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 2, 2006	9780618497867	21.60	30.00	22.80	No Bid
9	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 3, 2006	9780618497874	33.85	35.00	25.00	No Bid
10	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 4, 2006	9780618497881	55.65	48.00	31.36	No Bid
11	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 5, 2006	9780618497898	57.65	48.00	35.34	No Bid
12	Spanish, Avancemos I, SE	9780547871912	64.30	70.30	60.30	No Bid
13	Spanish, Avancemos II, SE	9780547871936	57.50	70.30	55.66	No Bid
14	Decisions for Health, Level Blue, Holt	9780030961588	25.40	9.92	37.14	No Bid
15	Fitness for Life, Human Kinetics	9780736065115	19.00	34.00	14.86	No Bid
16	Collections, Georgia Ed., Gr. 6	9780544092716	49.60	68.20	58.00	No Bid
17	Collections, Georgia Ed., Gr. 7	9780544092907	49.20	68.20	58.00	No Bid
18	Collections, Georgia Ed., Gr. 8	9780544092808	43.50	68.20	58.00	No Bid
19	Close Reader, Gr. 6	9780544087606	11.25	25.40	14.92	No Bid
20	Close Reader, Gr. 7	9780544090767	9.40	25.40	15.45	No Bid
21	Close Reader, Gr. 8	9780544089068	8.70	25.40	13.35	No Bid
22	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 6	9780544147645	10.90	16.25	7.35	No Bid
23	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 7	9780544147560	11.40	10.00	6.72	No Bid
24	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 8	9780544147584	10.90	16.25	9.37	No Bid
25	Western World: The Americas, Europe and the Pacific World, Ga. Ed., Holt McDougal	9780547368559	11.85	32.00	12.67	No Bid
26	Eastern World: Africa and Asia, Ga. Ed., Holt McDougal	9780547367934	44.75	46.00	45.44	No Bid
27	Georgia: A History of Change and Progress, Holt McDougal	9780547316017	63.60	42.00	48.57	No Bid
28	French Bien Dit I	9780547871790	51.40	58.00	52.83	No Bid
29	French Bien Dit II	9780547871677	54.65	58.00	43.91	No Bid
30	German Deutsch Aktuell I	9780821952054	45.50	36.00	32.39	No Bid
31	German Deutsch Aktuell II	9780821952061	38.35	36.00	40.61	No Bid
32	Lifetime Health, Holt	9780030962196	29.85	32.00	35.31	No Bid
33	Fitness for Life, Human Kinetics	9780736066754	10.50	18.00	30.05	No Bid
34	Close Reader, Gr. 9	9780544087699	13.35	15.00	11.70	No Bid
35	Close Reader, Gr. 10	9780544087620	13.90	25.40	12.90	No Bid
36	Close Reader, Gr. 11	9780544091191	14.55	15.00	14.27	No Bid

UNAUDITED COPY

Savannah/Chatham County Public School System

Bid 18-13

Bid Tabulation

Item #		ISBN #	Textbook Warehouse Price	Superior Text Price	Follett School Solutions, Inc. Price	Cengage Learning, Inc. Price
37	Close Reader, Gr. 12	9780544088412	11.15	25.40	13.90	No Bid
38	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 9	9780544147591	4.75	9.95	8.93	No Bid
39	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 10	9780544147607	4.25	9.95	8.18	No Bid
40	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 11	9780544147614	4.75	9.95	11.48	No Bid
41	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 12	9780544147638	4.50	16.25	9.10	No Bid
42	Coordinate Algebra Common Core GPS, Ga Ed., 2014, Holt	9780544022720	80.30	No Bid	33.20	No Bid
43	Analytic Geometry Common Core GPS, Ga Ed., 2014, Holt	9780544023000	82.90	No Bid	33.50	No Bid
44	Advanced Algebra Common Core GPS, Ga Ed., 2014, Holt	9780544022003	77.25	No Bid	30.62	No Bid
45	Larson Precalculus with Limits: A Graphing Approach, 6 th ed., 2012, Holt	9781111427641	116.40	116.00	83.20	No Bid
46	For All Practical Purposes, Bedford Freeman & Worth	9781429254816	47.50	112.00	56.34	No Bid
47	Financial Algebra, Cengage Learning	9780538449670	32.50	52.00	39.71	No Bid
48	Larson Calculus, 9 th ed., 2010, Holt	9780547212890	22.50	76.00	75.76	No Bid
49	The Practice of Statistics for AP, Bedford Freeman & Worth	9781429245593	109.00	96.00	78.40	No Bid
50	United States History, Survey, Ga. Ed., 2012, Prentice Hall	0132528061	15.80	9.95	17.33	No Bid
51	Glencoe World History, 2012, Glencoe	9780078799945	56.70	28.00	33.78	No Bid
52	Understanding Psychology, 2008, Glencoe	9780078745171	29.70	32.00	37.31	No Bid
53	Sociology: The Study of Human Relationships, 2010, Holt	9780544004419	34.30	No Bid	39.40	No Bid
54	Psychology, 6 th ed., Worth Publishers	1429244364	89.60	110.00	102.20	No Bid
	Prices quoted firm for one year Y/N		Y	Y	Y	
	Delivery		5-7 Days	10 Business Days	5-10 Days	
	Documents Signed Y/N:		Y	Y	Y	
	Minority Designation:		Not Applicable	N/M	N	

Textbook Warehouse, 936 Currie Drive, Alpharetta, Ga 30005

Superior Text, 151 Airport Industrial Dr., Ypsilanti, MI 48198

Follett School Solutions, Inc., 1340 Ridgeview Dr., McHenry, IL 60050

Tabulation By: Katrina Hagan, Purchasing Agent Certified by Joan Carter, Purchasing Agent

NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 10 TO LMWBE: 1 = A W 1 H I S L N M

NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 3 FROM LMWBE: 3 = A W H I S L N 2 M 1

KEY: A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W=WOMAN, H=HISPANIC, I=AMERICAN INDIAN, S=ASIAN AMERICAN, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL, M=MAJORITY