

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP – 6 Month Contract
BID 17-47

Bid opening date & time: June 20, 2017 @ 2:00 pm

Note: 1 addendum was issued on this project

| Item # | Description: Size Weight/Color Unit of Measure | Qty | Mac Papers 3350 Phillips Highway Jacksonville, FL 32207 904-396-5312 ph. 800-233-5732 fax | Veritiv Operating Co. 7016 A.D. Skinner Pkwy Jacksonville, FL 32256 904-348-8232 ph. 800-224-8799 fax | School Specialty W6316 Design Dr. Greenville, Wi 54942 800-554-7632 ph. 800-675-1775 fax | Milton- Jones Company NO BID |
|--------|--|-----|---|---|--|------------------------------------|
| 1 | 60# Planetary Purple, 8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075830 (5 ream/cs) | |
| 2 | 60# Fireball Fuchsia 8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/ per 8 075831 | |
| 3 | 60# Celestial Blue8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 1438737 | |
| 4 | 60# Gamma8.5x11, Green Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075821 | |
| 5 | 60# Terra Green8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075824 | |
| 6 | 60# Cosmic Orange Text, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075828 | |
| 7 | 60# Re-entry Red, 8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075836 | |
| 8 | 60# Solar Yellow, 8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075819 | |
| 9 | 60# Lift-Off, Lemon, 8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 4 | \$77.95 \$311.80 | \$80.45 \$321.80 | \$38.70 \$309.60/per 8 075827 | |
| 10 | 65# Planetary Purple, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 11 | 65# Pulsar Pink, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 12 | 65# Celestial Blue, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |

| Item # | Description: Size Weight/Color Unit of Measure | Qty | Mac Papers 3350 Phillips Highway Jacksonville, FL 32207 904-396-5312 ph. 800-233-5732 fax | Veritiv Operating Co. 7016 A.D. Skinner Pkwy Jacksonville, FL 32256 904-348-8232 ph. 800-224-8799 fax | School Specialty W6316 Design Dr. Greenville, WI 54942 800-554-7632 ph. 800-675-1775 fax | Milton- Jones Company NO BID |
|--------|--|-----|---|---|--|------------------------------------|
| 13 | 65# Gamma Green, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 14 | 65# Galaxy Gold, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 15 | 65# Cosmic Orange, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 16 | 65# Re-entry Red, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 17 | 65# Solar Yellow, 23x35, Cover, Case/500 shts | 4 | \$143.00 \$572.00 | \$137.04 \$548.16 | No Bid | |
| 18 | 60# Gold, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | No Bid | |
| 19 | 60# Green, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | No Bid | |
| 20 | 60# Yellow, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | \$67.10 \$671.00 1448901 | |
| 21 | 60# Pink, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | \$67.10 \$671.00 1448903 | |
| 22 | 60# Blue, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | \$67.10 \$671.00 1448900 | |
| 23 | 60# Ivory, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | \$67.10 \$671.00 1448902 | |
| 24 | 60# Tan, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | No Bid | |
| 25 | 60# Orchid, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | \$52.25 \$522.50 | \$50.91 \$509.10 | \$67.10 \$670.00 1449354 | |
| 26 | 60# Peach, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 10 | No Bid | \$50.91 \$509.10 | No Bid | |
| 27 | 20# Blue, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 3 | \$59.29 \$177.75 | \$48.63 \$145.89 | \$49.70 \$149.10 054660 | |
| 28 | 20# Yellow, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 3 | \$59.29 \$177.75 | \$48.63 \$145.89 | \$49.70 \$149.10 054666 | |

| Item # | Description: Size Weight/Color Unit of Measure | Qty | Mac Papers 3350 Phillips Highway Jacksonville, FL 32207 904-396-5312 ph. 800-233-5732 fax | Veritiv Operating Co. 7016 A.D. Skinner Pkwy Jacksonville, FL 32256 904-348-8232 ph. 800-224-8799 fax | School Specialty W6316 Design Dr. Greenville, WI 54942 800-554-7632 ph. 800-675-1775 fax | Milton- Jones Company NO BID |
|--------|--|-----|---|---|--|------------------------------------|
| 29 | 20# Green, 8.5x11, Case/5000 shts | 3 | \$59.29 \$177.75 | \$48.63 \$145.89 | No Bid | |
| 30 | 110# Green, Index, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$53.50 \$267.50 | \$47.80 \$239.00 | \$65.92 \$329.60 1301577 | |
| 31 | 110# Canary, 8.5x11, Index, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$53.50 \$267.50 | \$47.80 \$239.00 | \$65.92 \$329.60 1301579 | |
| 32 | 110# Blue, 8.5x11, Index, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$53.50 \$267.50 | \$47.80 \$239.00 | \$65.92 \$329.60 1301575 | |
| 33 | 110# Ivory, 8.5x11, Index, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$53.50 \$267.50 | \$47.80 \$239.00 | \$65.92 \$329.60 1301573 | |
| 34 | 110# Salmon, 8.5x11, Index, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$53.50 \$267.50 | \$47.80 \$239.00 | No Bid | |
| 35 | 67# Gold, 8.5x11, Exact, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$46.50 \$232.50 | \$35.40 \$177.00 | No Bid | |
| 36 | 67# Pink, 8.5x11, Exact, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$46.50 \$232.50 | \$35.40 \$177.00 | No Bid | |
| 37 | 67# Orchid, 8.5x11, Exact, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$46.50 \$232.50 | \$35.40 \$177.00 | No Bid | |
| 38 | 80# White V.B., 8.5x11, Exact, Case/2000 shts | 10 | \$46.50 \$232.50 | \$40.11 \$401.10 | No Bid | |
| 39 | 67# White V.B., 8.5x11, Exact, Case/2000 shts | 10 | \$40.25 \$402.50 | \$33.57 \$335.70 | \$49.52 \$495.20 1301549 | |
| 40 | 100# White, 8.5x11, Cover, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$74.75 \$373.50 (Case/1600shts) | \$63.11 \$315.55 | No Bid | |
| 41 | 100# White, 11x17, Cover, Case/800 shts | 5 | \$74.75 \$373.50 | \$53.20 \$266.00 | No Bid | |
| 42 | 100# White, 12x18, Cover, Case/800 shts | 5 | \$87.95 \$439.75 | \$61.43 \$307.15 | No Bid | |
| 43 | 80# White, 23x35, Cover, Carton/500 shts | 5 | \$139.50 \$695.50 | \$105.95 \$529.75 | No Bid | |
| 44 | 80# White, 8.5x11, Cover, Case/2000 shts | 5 | \$60.00 \$300.00 | \$47.80 \$239.00 | \$79.60 \$398.00 1480413-pk/250 | |

| Item # | Description: Size Weight/Color Unit of Measure | Qty | Mac Papers 3350 Phillips Highway Jacksonville, FL 32207 904-396-5312 ph. 800-233-5732 fax | Veritiv Operating Co. 7016 A.D. Skinner Pkwy Jacksonville, FL 32256 904-348-8232 ph. 800-224-8799 fax | School Specialty W6316 Design Dr. Greenville, WI 54942 800-554-7632 ph. 800-675-1775 fax | Milton- Jones Company NO BID |
|--------|--|------|---|---|--|------------------------------------|
| 45 | 80# White, 11x17, Cover, Case/200 | 5 | \$63.00 \$315.00 (Case/1000 shts) | \$50.38 \$251.90 | \$13.93 \$69.65 1282269-60# | |
| 46 | 20# White, 8.5x14, Text, Case/5000 shts | 20 | \$48.50 \$970.00 | \$36.82 \$736.40 | \$43.06 \$861.20 1301361 | |
| 47 | 24# Bond White, 8.5x11, Text, Case/4000 shts | 5 | \$86.96 \$434.80 | \$103.58 \$517.90 | \$71.28 \$356.40 1115046 | |
| 48 | 70# White, 8.5x11, Text, Case 4000 shts | 40 | \$40.00 \$1600.00 | \$47.04 \$1881.60 | No Bid | |
| 49 | 70# White, 11x17, Text, Case 200 shts | 40 | \$44.50 \$1780.00 | \$49.64 \$1984.60 | No Bid | |
| 50 | 20# White 3-Hole Punch, 8.5x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 40 | \$38.00 \$1520.00 | \$28.98 \$1159.20 | \$45.10 \$1804.00 1299361 | |
| 51 | 22 PT #90, Chipboard, 8.5x11, Bundle/963 | 5 | \$41.59 \$207.95 | \$23.03 \$115.15 | \$2.45 \$12.25 9x12; pk/24; 085564 | |
| 52 | 22 PT #90 Chipboard, 8.5x14, Bundle/756 | 5 | \$41.59 \$207.95 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 53 | 22 PT #90 Chipboard, 11x17, Bundle/481 | 5 | \$41.59 \$207.95 | \$26.38 \$131.90 | \$3.82 \$19.10 12x18; pk/24; 085572 | |
| 54 | Grey Linen Setup Calling Card Box, 6 x 3.625 x 2, Rigid, Carton/100 | 3 | \$70.50 \$211.50 | No Bid | No bid | |
| 55 | Letter Box, Carton/100 | 70 | \$56.50 \$3955.00 | \$57.94 \$4055.80 Carton/200 | No bid | |
| 56 | Letter Box, 11.125 x 8.625 x 2, Carton/100 | 70 | \$77.50 \$5425.00 | \$63.49 \$4444.30 Carton/150 | No bid | |
| 57 | 32ECT Brown Karft Corrugated, 11/4 x 8 3/4 x 12, Cartons, Unit 500/25/Bundle | 2500 | \$.58 \$1450.00 | No Bid | \$24.03 \$2403.00 1000; pk/25; 1492572 | |
| 58 | 32ECT Brown Karft Corrugated, 17-1/4 x 11-1/4 x 10-1/4, Cartons. Unit/250/Bundle | 1500 | \$.78 \$1170.00 | No Bid | \$34.89 \$2616.75 75 qty;pk/20; 1492573 | |
| 59 | Bx75GA CF Preperf Shink Film (Role), 18", Roll | 4 | \$172.00 \$688.00 | No Bid | No bid | |

| Item # | Description: Size Weight/Color Unit of Measure | Qty | Mac Papers 3350 Phillips Highway Jacksonville, FL 32207 904-396-5312 ph. 800-233-5732 fax | Veritiv Operating Co. 7016 A.D. Skinner Pkwy Jacksonville, FL 32256 904-348-8232 ph. 800-224-8799 fax | School Specialty W6316 Design Dr. Greenville, Wi 54942 800-554-7632 ph. 800-675-1775 fax | Milton- Jones Company NO BID |
|--------|--|---------|---|---|--|------------------------------------|
| 60 | Bx75GA CF Preperf Shink Film (Role), 18", Roll | 4 | \$178.00 \$712.00 Bx CF Preperf Shrink Film 100ga | No Bid | No bid | |
| 61 | 248M 80# Natural Cougar Opague Smooth, 2335, Cover, Case/500 shts – WM White Mccord 99 | 4 | \$200.00 \$800.00 | \$108.13 \$432.52 WM White Mccord Opg | No bid | |
| 62 | 20# White Copy Paper, 8x11, Text, Case/5000 shts | 400 | \$27.00 \$10800.00 | \$26.65 \$10660.00 | No bid | |
| 63 | 60# White Copy Paper, 8x11, Text, Case/4000 shts | 20 | \$43.00 \$860.00 | \$34.55 \$691.00 | No bid | |
| 64 | 60# White Copy Paper, 8x14, Text, Case/4000 shts | 20 | \$46.50 \$930.00 | \$46.82 \$936.40 | No bid | |
| 65 | 80# White Copy Paper, 8x11, Text, Case/2400 shts | 5 | \$45.50 \$227.50 Case/3200 shts | \$43.05 \$215.25 Case/3200 shts | No bid | |
| 66 | 100# White Copy Paper, 17x11, ext, Case/750 shts | 5 | \$47.00 \$235.00 (Case/1250 shts) | \$44.33 \$221.65 Case/1250 shts | No bid | |
| 67 | 100# White Copy Paper, 8x11, Cover, Case/1500 shts | 5 | \$74.75 \$373.75 (Case/1600 shts) | \$50.49 \$252.45 Case/1600 shts | No bid | |
| 68 | 80# White Hammermill Color Copy, 8.5x11, Cover, Case/1500 shts | 10 | \$73.00 \$730.00 (Case/2000 hts) | \$63.98 \$639.50 Case/2000 shts | \$59.70 \$597.00 1480413 | |
| 69 | 80# White Hammermill Copy, 11x17, Cover, Case/1000 shts | 30 | \$79.00 \$2370.00 | \$66.65 \$1999.50 | \$55.68 \$1670.40 | |
| 70 | 100# White Hammermill Copy, 8.5x11, Cover, Case/1500 shts | 10 | \$68.75 \$687.50 | \$80.07 \$800.70 Case/2000 shts | No Bid | |
| 71 | 100# White Hammermill Color Copy, 11x17, Cover, Case/2500 shts | 30 | \$68.75 \$2062.50 | \$62.56 \$1876.80 Case/750 shts | No Bid | |
| 71 | #10-24# White Woven Side Seam Window Envelope, 4-1/8 x 9.5, Text, Case/2500, Box 500 | 50 M | \$36.00 \$720.00 Regular, 20 per ctn | No Bid | \$25.39 \$6347.50 1066353; 250/pk | |
| 72 | #10-24# White Woven Side Seam Window Envelope, 4-1/8 x 9.5, Case/2500, Box/500 | 50 M | \$41.00 \$820.00 20 per ctn | No Bid | \$29.39 \$7347.50 1314430; 250/pk | |
| | | | Bid Total \$56,658.10 | \$50,188.12 | \$32,755.95 | |

| | | | | |
|---------------|--|---|-----|----|
| LWMBE | | Y | | NL |
| DOC. SIGNED | | Y | Y | Y |
| ADDENDUM | | 1 | 1,2 | 1 |
| NO. OF COPIES | | 2 | 2 | 1 |

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Ontario Washington Sr.  CERTIFIED BY: Kathleen Watson Scott K.W. Scott

NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 17 TO LWMBE A W 1 H L N M
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 3 FROM LWMBE: A W H L N 1 M

KEY: MFBE DOCS= LETTER OF ASSURANCE/WAIVER/PARTICIPATION FORMS

MINORITY DESIGNATIONS: A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W= WOMAN, H= HISPANIC, L=LOCAL, M=MAJORITY