

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
PLEATED AND PANEL AIR FILTERS (ANNUAL CONTRACT)

Bid 18-14

BID CLOSING DATE & TIME: September 26, 2017 at 2:00 PM

Note: 1 addendum were issued on this project

	Bidder:	Est. Annual Usage	Filter Buy 101 Pope Street Talladega, AL 35160 855-345-8289 Phone 256-615-8765 Fax	Glennville Electric Motors, Inc. 315 E. Banks Street Glennville, GA 30427 912-654-1921 Phone 912-654-0548 Fax	Bruce Air Filter Company 2619 West Boulevard Charlotte, NC 28208 704-391-7474 phone 704-392-2022 Fax	Tri Dim Filter Corp. 93 Industrial Drive Louisa, VA 23093 803-807-8184 Phone 775-806-4296 Fax
ITEM:	PLEATED FILTERS					
1.	7 7/8 x 17 7/8 x 1	50	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 11.64	BL8 3.10	23007HE07HE140 3.52
2.	8 x 21½ x 1	65	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 11.64	BL8 3.10	2300821DE140 3.52
3.	9 3/8 x 15 3/8 x 1	60	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 11.64	BL8 3.10	23009CE15CE140 3.52
4.	9 3/8 x 17 7/8 x 1	20	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 11.64	BL8 3.10	2309CE17HE140 3.52
5.	9 ¾ x 20 7/8 x 1	10	Filter Buy 3.42	102041299 11.76	BL8 3.32	2309GE20HE140 3.68
6.	10 x 13 ½ x 1	240	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 10.82	BL8 3.10	2301013DE140 3.52
7.	10 x 16 x 1	10	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 11.64	BL8 3.10	2301016140 3.52
8.	10 x 20 x 1	5	Filter Buy 2.08	102700001 6.08	XTP 1.54	2301020140 2.06
9.	12 x 20 x 1	175	Filter Buy 2.00	102041002 8.18	XTP 1.64	2301220140 2.06
10.	12 x 24 x 2	240	Filter Buy 2.40	102700012 5.38	XTP 1.74	2301224240 2.06
11.	12 3/8 x 15 ½ x 1	240	Filter Buy 3.42	102041199 10.82	BL8 3.32	23012CE15DE140 3.52
12.	13 ¾ x 27 ¾ x 1	60	Filter Buy 4.20	102041399 12.86	BL8 3.83	23013GE27GE140 7.03
13.	14 x 20 x 2	70	Filter Buy 2.54	102700013 6.58	XTP 1.83	2301420240 2.22
14.	16 x 16 x 2	80	Filter Buy 2.88	102042005 8.14	XTP 2.29	2301616240 2.36
15.	16 x 20 x 1	120	Filter Buy 2.15	102700006 5.16	XTP 1.60	2301620140 2.17
16.	16 x 20 x 2	1740	Filter Buy 1.93	102700016 5.30	XTP 1.58	2301620240 2.22
17.	16 x 20 x 4	40	Filter Buy 3.75	102700025 12.72	XTP 3.30	2301620440 3.48
18.	16x24x2	200	Filter Buy 2.73	102700053 7.32	XTP 2.06	2301624240 2.48
19.	16 x 25 x 1	470	Filter Buy 2.01	1027000007 6.34	XTP 1.78	2301625140 2.32
20.	16 x 25 x 2	2140	Filter Buy 2.42	102700017 6.60	XTP 1.80	2301625240 2.48

SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
PLEATED AND PANEL AIR FILTERS (ANNUAL CONTRACT)
Bid 18-14

	Bidder:	Est. Annual Usage	Filter Buy 101 Pope Street Talladega, AL 35160 855-345-8289 Phone 256-615-8765 Fax	Glennville Electric Motors, Inc. 315 E. Banks Street Glennville, GA 30427 912-654-1921 Phone 912-654-0548 Fax	Bruce Air Filter Company 2619 West Boulevard Charlotte, NC 28208 704-391-7474 phone 704-392-2022 Fax	Tri Dim Filter Corp. 93 Industrial Drive Louisa, VA 23093 803-807-8184 Phone 775-806-4296 Fax
21.	16 x 25 x 4	150	Filter Buy 3.82	102700026 11.74	XTP 3.72	2301625440 3.89
22.	16 x 30 x 1	215	Filter Buy 4.71	102041018 8.92	XTP 2.88	2301630140 2.91
23.	16 x 32 x 1	120	Filter Buy 4.99	102042599 14.86	BL8 4.80	2301632240 7.65
24.	17 x 26 x 1	190	Filter Buy 4.71	102041499 13.96	BL8 4.01	2301726140 7.35
25.	17 x 34 x 1	210	Filter Buy 4.99	102041599 14.08	BL8 4.80	2301734140 7.35
26.	18 x 18 x 1	10	Filter Buy 2.94	102041009 8.46	XTP 2.39	2301818140 3.74
27.	18 x 18 x 2	225	Filter Buy 2.81	102042007 9.08	XTP 2.34	2301818240 4.24
28.	18 x 20 x 1	20	Filter Buy 2.74	102041015 8.54	XTP 2.18	2301820140 2.52
29.	18 x 20 x 2	80	Filter Buy 3.64	102042015 8.74	XTP 2.39	2301820240 2.48
30.	18 x 25 x 1	165	Filter Buy 2.76	102041011 8.60	XTP 2.21	2301825140 2.67
31.	20 x 20 x 1	305	Filter Buy 2.02	102700008 6.36	XTP 1.78	2302020140 2.32
32.	20 x 20 x 2	2175	Filter Buy 2.42	102700019 6.58	XTP 1.79	2302020240 2.48
33.	20 x 20 x 4	40	Filter Buy 4.23	102700028 13.36	XTP 4.00	2302020440 3.89
34.	20 x 24 x 2	840	Filter Buy 2.73	102700020 6.68	XTP 2.35	2302024240 2.67
35.	20 x 25 x 1	240	Filter Buy 2.44	102700009 5.98	XTP 2.09	2302025140 2.52
36.	20 x 25 x 2	2400	Filter Buy 2.98	102700021 6.30	XTP 2.11	2302025240 2.73
37.	20 x 30 x 1	180	Filter Buy 3.29	102041012 8.92	XTP 3.14	2302030140 3.14
38.	20 x 30 x 2	120	Filter Buy 3.82	102042010 9.28	XTP 3.16	2302030240 3.81
39.	20 x 34 x 1	220	Filter Buy 5.23	102041699 14.20	BL8 5.73	2302034140 7.47
40.	20 x 34 x 2	45	Filter Buy 6.57	102042699 15.78	BL8 7.51	2302034240 8.47
41.	22 x 22 x 1	25	Filter Buy 4.71	102041499 13.96	BL8 4.17	2302222140 4.08

**SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
PLEATED AND PANEL AIR FILTERS (ANNUAL CONTRACT)**

Bid 18-14

	Bidder:	Est. Annual Usage	Filter Buy 101 Pope Street Talladega, AL 35160 855-345-8289 Phone 256-615-8765 Fax	Glennville Electric Motors, Inc. 315 E. Banks Street Glennville, GA 30427 912-654-1921 Phone 912-654-0548 Fax	Bruce Air Filter Company 2619 West Boulevard Charlotte, NC 28208 704-391-7474 phone 704-392-2022 Fax	Tri Dim Filter Corp. 93 Industrial Drive Louisa, VA 23093 803-807-8184 Phone 775-806-4296 Fax
42.	24 x 24 x 1	235	Filter Buy 2.53	102700010 7.52	XTP 2.12	2302424140 2.73
43.	24 x 24 x 2	520	Filter Buy 3.06	102700022 7.70	XTP 2.39	2302424240 3.13
44.	24 x 30 x 1	105	Filter Buy 4.05	102041013 9.56	XTP 3.18	2302430140 3.28
45.	28 x 30 x 2	45	Filter Buy 11.47	1020424992 31.48	BL8 7.86	2302830240 2.41
46.	9 ½ x 21 x 1	30	Filter Buy 3.42	102041299 11.76	BL8 3.32	23009DE21140 3.52
47.	20 5/8 x29 ¾ x2	200	Filter Buy 6.57	102042699 15.78	BL8 6.59	23020FE29GE240 8.47
48.	24 x28 x2	200	Filter Buy 6.57	102042699 15.78	BL8 6.59	2302428240 8.47
49.	30 x36x 2	200	Filter Buy 12.46	1020425992 31.98	BL8 10.11	2303036240 15.30
50.	10 x 20 x 2	30	Filter Buy 4.52	102700011 6.60	XTP 1.74	2301020240 2.06
51.	10 x 28 x 1	115	Filter Buy 3.69	102041299 11.76	BL8 3.51	2301028140 7.03
52.	12 x 24 x 4 MERV 13	96	Filter Buy 8.67	102714023 15.14	DP13 5.04	2481224413 7.06
53.	14 x 20 x 1	15	Filter Buy 4.03	102714003 7.72	XTP 1.65	2301420140 2.22
54.	15 x 20 x 1	24	Filter Buy 4.18	102714005 7.06	XTP 1.64	2301520140 2.22
55.	16 x 16 x 1	20	Filter Buy 4.47	102101007 9.34	XTP 2.12	2301616140 2.36
56.	16 x 22 x 1	20	Filter Buy 4.20	102101399 15.48	XTP 3.98	2301622140 3.74
57.	16 x 25 x 4 MERV 13	120	Filter Buy 11.06	102714026 17.46	DP13 9.81	2481625413 9.23
58.	16 x 25 x 4	30	Filter Buy 3.82	102714026 17.46	XTP 3.72	2301625440 3.89
59.	18 x 24 x 2	70	Filter Buy 2.90	102714018 11.02	XTP 2.27	2301824240 2.57
60.	18 x 25 x 2	30	Filter Buy 3.05	102102009 13.24	XTP 2.30	2301825240 2.67
61.	20 x 22 x 1	5	Filter Buy 4.71	102101499 16.42	XTP 3.01	2302022140 4.08
62.	20 x 24 x 4	45	Filter Buy 4.74	102714029 21.16	XTP 4.98	2302024440 4.24

**SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
PLEATED AND PANEL AIR FILTERS (ANNUAL CONTRACT)**

Bid 18-14

	Bidder:	Est. Annual Usage	Filter Buy 101 Pope Street Talladega, AL 35160 855-345-8289 Phone 256-615-8765 Fax	Glennville Electric Motors, Inc. 315 E. Banks Street Glennville, GA 30427 912-654-1921 Phone 912-654-0548 Fax	Bruce Air Filter Company 2619 West Boulevard Charlotte, NC 28208 704-391-7474 phone 704-392-2022 Fax	Tri Dim Filter Corp. 93 Industrial Drive Louisa, VA 23093 803-807-8184 Phone 775-806-4296 Fax
63.	20 x 28 x 1	60	Filter Buy 4.99	102101599 15.94	BL8 4.73	2302028140 7.35
64.	21 x 30 x 2	24	Filter Buy 6.57	102102011 16.50	BL8 6.50	2302130240 8.47
65.	24 x 24 x 4	40	Filter Buy 5.37	102714031 22.42	XTP 4.75	2302424440 4.59
66.	24 x 30 x 2	48	Filter Buy 6.91	102102011 16.50	BL8 6.50	2302430240 8.47
67.	24 x 28 x 1	160	Filter Buy 5.23	102101699 17.14	BL8 6.26	2302428140 7.47
68.	25 x 25 x 2	60	Filter Buy 3.51	102714050 15.16	XTP 2.94	2302525240 3.53
69.	25 x 25 x 1	5	Filter Buy 3.36	102101014 12.68	XTP 2.41	2302525140 3.08
70.	28 x 30 x 1	160	Filter Buy 9.34	1021014992 33.24	BL8 7.17	2302830140 8.15
71.	18 x 24 x1	200	Filter Buy 2.56	102101016 10.42	XTP 2.36	2301824140 2.67
72.	18.625 x 25.375 x2	300	Filter Buy 6.23	102102499 19.26	BL8 5.01	23018FE25CE240 7.35
73.	20 x 22 x 1	200	Filter Buy 4.71	102101499 16.42	XTP 3.01	2302022140 4.08
ITEM:	30 DAY FIBERGLASS FILTERS:					
74.	16 x 16 x 1	20	No Bid	274160160 5.86	F312 .96	3.29
75.	16 x 20 x 1	180	No Bid	274160200 3.70	F312 .85	3.38
76.	18 x 18 x 1	90	No Bid	274180180 6.04	F312 1.24	3.38
77.	18 x 20 x 1	165	No Bid	274180200 6.04	F312 1.22	3.38
78.	18 x 25 x 1	60	No Bid	274180250 5.40	F312 1.27	3.60
79.	20 x 20 x 1	30	No Bid	274200200 4.68	F312 .85	3.60
80.	20 x 30 x 1	15	No Bid	274200300 6.56	F312 1.45	3.95
ITEM:	ROLL FILTER MEDIA					
81.	16" x 90' x 1"	175	Filter Buy 22.72	55001690 80.64	BF090 23.75	0961690 34.05

**SAVANNAH-CHATHAM COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION BID TABULATION
PLEATED AND PANEL AIR FILTERS (ANNUAL CONTRACT)**

Bid 18-14

82.	20" x 90' x 1"	100	Filter Buy 27.90	55002090 92.58	BF090 29.70	0962090 41.61
83.	25" x 90' x 1"	7	Filter Buy 34.88	55002590 107.50	BF090 37.12	0962590 50.59
ITEM:	PRE-CUT FILTER MEDIA PADS:					
84.	16 x 32 x 1	6300	Filter Buy 2.31	550016032 3.28	BF0900 .74	1701632 1.78
85.	20 x 32 x 1	3000	Filter Buy 2.88	550020032 3.66	BF090 1.01	1702032 2.03
86.	26 x 26 x 1	3000	Filter Buy 3.05	550026026 4.58	BF090 1.05	1702626 2.13
87.	20 x 27 x 1	3000	Filter Buy 2.44	550020027 3.14	BF090 .80	1702027 1.78
ITEM:	METAL FRAMES:					
88.	15 3/4" x 29 3/4" x 1	100	No Bid	118710409 46.64	EM822 7.90	8.02
89.	19 3/4" x 29 3/4" x 1	30	No Bid	118710411 49.62	EM822 8.64	8.77
	Total Bid Cost		104,301.40	223,171.14	69,302.34	103,524.71
	Delivery (Days):		None Stated	None Stated	15-20 days	15 days
	MWBE Status:		None Stated	None Stated	Majority	N
	Document Signed?		Y	N	Y	Y
	Addendum Acknowledged?		N	N	N	1

TABULATION PERFORMED BY: Kathleen Watson-Scott

CERTIFIED BY: Bethany Burnett

NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 7 TO LMWBE: 1 A W H S I M L N
 NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 4 FROM LMWBE: 0 A W 1 H S I M L N 4

KEY TO MINORITY DEISGNATIONS: A=AFRICAN AMERICAN, W= WOMAN, H= HISPANIC, M=MAJORITY, L=LOCAL, N=NON-LOCAL
 S=ASIAN AMERICAN, I=AMERICAN INDIAN