

Savannah/Chatham County Public School System

Bid 16-51

Bid Tabulation

Bid Opening Date & Time: January 21, 2016 @ 11:00 AM

Note: No addendum was issued on this project

Item #		ISBN #	Follett School Solutions Price	Textbook Broker Price	Superior Text Price	Textbook Warehouse Price
1	SRA/McGraw Art Connections, Gr. K, 2005	0076018199	6.31	8.00	20.70	5.95
2	SRA/McGraw Art Connections, Gr. 1, 2005	0076018202	5.68	8.00	20.60	5.95
3	SRA/McGraw Art Connections, Gr. 2, 2005	0076018210	6.10	7.45	17.60	5.50
4	SRA/McGraw Art Connections, Gr. 3, 2005	0076018229	6.58	27.25	11.40	5.95
5	SRA/McGraw Art Connections, Gr. 4, 2005	0076018237	10.95	41.85	13.80	12.75
6	SRA/McGraw Art Connections, Gr. 5, 2005	0076018245	6.31	21.85	13.60	5.95
7	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. K	9780544338487	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1809.05
8	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 1	9780544338371	2054.25	No Bid	No Bid	2126.13
9	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 2	9780544338388	1156.95	No Bid	No Bid	1197.40
10	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 3	9780544338432	No Bid	No Bid	2082.19	No bid
11	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 4	9780544338456	11036.20	No Bid	No Bid	1072.45
12	Journeys – Common Core GA – Classroom Kit, Gr. 5	9780544338470	No Bid	No Bid	1398.87	No bid
13	HMH Your Health, Gr. K - Kit, 1999	0153120320	33.15	No Bid	No Bid	out of print
14	HMH Your Health, Gr. 1, 1999	0153101393	4.50	8.95	13.80	4.25
15	HMH Your Health, Gr. 2, 1999	0153101407	6.85	13.95	13.40	10.75
16	HMH Your Health, Gr. 3, 1999	0153101415	10.86	20.95	7.90	10.75
17	HMH Your Health, Gr. 4, 1999	0153101423	18.40	20.95	13.90	13.75
18	HMH Your Health, Gr. 5, 1999	0153101431	11.74	15.95	17.90	13.75
19	McGraw Spotlight on Music, Gr. 1, 2005	0022956743	29.96	29.55	22.20	28.50
20	McGraw Spotlight on Music, Gr. 2, 2005	0022956751	19.87	30.55	31.20	28.50
21	McGraw Spotlight on Music, Gr. 3, 2005	002295676X	31.14	40.54	42.40	32.00
22	McGraw Spotlight on Music, Gr. 4, 2005	0022956778	37.08	38.55	33.90	29.75
23	McGraw Spotlight on Music, Gr. 5, 2005	0022956786	24.02	40.55	30.60	29.75
24	HMH Science, Gr. 1, 2009	0618884882	33.85	59.95	No Bid	51.20
25	HMH Science, Gr. 2, 2009	0618884890	23.22	35.55	37.00	29.75
26	HMH Science, Gr. 3, 2009	0618884904	25.78	40.55	50.30	42.15
27	HMH Science, Gr. 4, 2009	0618884912	32.87	40.55	No Bid	49.70
28	HMH Science, Gr. 5, 2009	0618884920	40.20	49.55	59.90	57.50
29	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 1, 2006	9780618497850	20.12	27.55	No Bid	23.75
30	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 2, 2006	9780618497867	19.79	36.55	No Bid	24.75
31	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 3, 2006	9780618497874	21.92	39.55	No Bid	46.90
32	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 4, 2006	9780618497881	37.99	55.00	No Bid	62.25
33	Houghton Mifflin Social Studies, Gr. 5, 2006	9780618497898	33.12	59.95	No Bid	64.00

Savannah/Chatham County Public School System

Bid 16-51

Bid Tabulation

Item #		ISBN #	Follett School Solutions	Textbook Broker	Superior Text	Textbook Warehouse
			Price	Price	Price	Price
34	Understanding Art, 2005	007846529X	11.30		37.60	9.50
35	En Espanol, Level 1A, 2004	061825059X	19.91	34.55	17.60	16.85
36	En Espanol, Level 1B, 2004	0618250611	33.91	34.55	22.80	15.50
37	En Espanol, Level 1, 2004	0618250573	30.90	34.55	23.10	21.50
38	En Espanol, Level 2, 2004	0618250638	34.32	32.55	16.80	18.50
39	En Espanol, Level 3, 2004	0618250689	27.42	29.55	18.20	17.25
40	En Espanol, Level 4, 2004	0618250654	39.89	29.55	18.80	15.00
41	Discovering French, Lev 1A, 2004	0395881439	8.07	54.55	15.70	7.80
42	Discovering French, Lev 1B, 2004	0618032150	9.00	54.55	8.99	7.80
43	Discovering French, Lev 1, 2004	0395874823	30.97	35.55	22.50	33.75
44	Discovering French, Lev 2, 2004	0395874890	32.10	35.55	23.20	29.70
45	Discovering French, Lev 3, 2004	0395874866	29.04	35.55	20.70	26.75
46	Ecce Romani, Level 1, 2000	0673575853	27.17	37.55	37.30	22.00
47	Ecce Romani, Level 2, 2000	0673575861	19.29	39.55	37.80	32.00
48	Ecce Romani, Level 3, 2000	067357587X	5.80	39.55	13.70	5.50
49	Decisions for Health, Level Blue, Holt	9780030961588	44.28	45.55	47.00	44.20
50	Fitness for Life, Human Kinetics	9780736065115	22.75	No Bid	29.70	21.00
51	Collections, Georgia Ed., Gr. 6	9780544092716	48.83	50.55	66.85	54.15
52	Collections, Georgia Ed., Gr. 7	9780544092907	48.83	50.55	66.85	54.15
53	Collections, Georgia Ed., Gr. 8	9780544092808	48.83	79.95	66.80	54.15
54	Close Reader, Gr. 6	9780544087606	19.38	79.95	17.20	19.45
55	Close Reader, Gr. 7	9780544090767	19.38	79.97	No Bid	19.45
56	Close Reader, Gr. 8	9780544089068	19.38	79.17	20.00	19.45
57	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 6	9780544147645	12.92	No Bid	No Bid	12.45
58	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 7	9780544147560	12.16	No Bid	No Bid	12.45
59	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 8	9780544147584	12.16	No Bid	No Bid	12.45
60	Making Music, 2005, Silver Burdett, Gr. 6	0382365747	44.64	44.55	51.70	35.75
61	Making Music, 2005, Silver Burdett, Gr. 7	0382365755	13.77	25.55	29.30	11.00
62	Making Music, 2005, Silver Burdett, Gr. 8	0382365763	11.50	25.55	11.49	11.00
63	Holt Science & Technology: Earth Science	030935466	50.20	No Bid	106.65	82.95
64	Holt Science & Technology: Life Science	030935458	54.20	No Bid	106.65	82.95
65	Holt Science & Technology: Physical Science	030935474	54.20	No Bid	106.65	82.95
66	Western World: The Americas, Europe and the Pacific World, Ga. Ed., Holt McDougal	9780547368559	56.20	64.55	No Bid	38.00
67	Eastern World: Africa and Asia, Ga. Ed., Holt McDougal	9780547367934	46.33	64.55	No Bid	50.50
68	Georgia: A History of Change and Progress, Holt McDougal	9780547316017	67.84	No Bid	36.90	62.00

Savannah/Chatham County Public School System

Bid 16-51

Bid Tabulation

Item #		ISBN #	Follett School Solutions	Textbook Broker	Superior Text	Textbook Warehouse
			Price	Price	Price	Price
69	Art Talk, 2005	0078305993	53.40	No Bid	21.10	31.50
70	En Espanol, Level 4, 2004	0618250654	No Bid	No Bid	18.80	15.00
71	Komm mit!, Level 1, 2003	0030565979	39.60	24.55	20.90	23.75
72	Komm mit!, Level 2, 2003	0030565987	33.22	24.55	14.90	21.50
73	Komm mit!, Level 3, 2003	0030565995	8.83	24.55	16.70	7.50
74	Lifetime Health, Holt	9780030962196	54.96	59.50	45.10	56.95
75	Fitness for Life, Human Kinetics	9780736066754	19.32	23.55	19.90	17.00
76	Close Reader, Gr. 9	9780544087699	19.38	No Bid	12.80	18.00
77	Close Reader, Gr. 10	9780544087620	19.38	No Bid	17.60	18.00
78	Close Reader, Gr. 11	9780544091191	19.38	No Bid	18.50	18.00
79	Close Reader, Gr. 12	9780544088412	19.38	No Bid	19.30	18.00
80	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 9	9780544147591	12.80	No Bid	9.80	10.20
81	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 10	9780544147607	12.80	No Bid	12.60	8.25
82	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 11	9780544147614	12.80	No Bid	10.00	10.20
83	Common Core Assessment Guide, Gr. 12	9780544147638	12.80	No Bid	12.50	10.20
84	Coordinate Algebra Common Core GPS, Ga Ed., 2014, Holt	9780544022720	78.95	No Bid	No Bid	81.15
85	Analytic Geometry Common Core GPS, Ga Ed., 2014, Holt	9780544023000	74.30	No Bid	No Bid	81.15
86	Advanced Algebra Common Core GPS, Ga Ed., 2014, Holt	9780544022003	79.05	No Bid	No Bid	82.95
87	Larson Precalculus with Limits: A Graphing Approach, 6 th ed., 2012, Holt	9781111427641	90.60	No Bid	125.70	99.50
88	For All Practical Purposes, Bedford Freeman & Worth	9781429254816	66.66	75.55	No Bid	53.00
89	Financial Algebra, Cengage Learning	9780538449670	59.85	No Bid	19.40	22.00
90	Larson Calculus, 9 th ed., 2010, Holt	9780547212890	97.40	109.00	53.20	69.35
91	The Practice of Statistics for AP, Bedford Freeman & Worth	9781429245593	70.40	101.00	99.30	91.25
92	Holt Science Spectrum: Physical Science	0030969530	49.05	62.55	77.00	73.00
93	Holt Biology	0030964016	55.28	59.95	No Bid	64.50
94	Chemistry: Matter & Change, Glencoe	007874637X	57.57	54.55	68.50	68.00
95	Holt Physics	0030368162	55.56	48.95	52.70	78.50
96	Anatomy & Physiology, 2008, Glencoe	9780073293684	61.00	109.00	48.40	55.00
97	Holt Environmental Science	0030947626	53.48	59.95	59.20	75.75
98	Holt Earth Science	0030947677	55.60	68.55	35.20	52.00
99	Biology, AP, Prentice Hall	0805367772	77.76	No Bid	17.80	39.75

Savannah/Chatham County Public School System
 Bid 16-51
 Bid Tabulation

Item #		ISBN #	Follett School Solutions Price	Textbook Broker Price	Superior Text Price	Textbook Warehouse Price
100	Chemistry, Glencoe	9780073268279	88.06	89.95	84.50	56.75
101	Physics, Principles with Applications	0131844612	78.17	42.55	78.80	73.50
102	Environment: The Science Behind the Stories, Prentice Hall	0131346423	57.07	68.55	52.20	44.70
103	Modern Biology, Holt	0030367697	57.56	68.55	72.70	69.85
104	Modern Chemistry, Holt	0030999979	48.93	34.55	42.40	48.00
105	Physics: Principles and Problems, 2009, Glencoe	0078807212	61.72	44.55	61.70	54.00
106	Glencoe Physical Science, Ga. Ed.	0078785332	45.20	50.55	51.20	54.00
107	Oceanography, Holt	0495112860	84.00	44.55	82.90	72.00
108	Astronomy Today, Prentice Hall	0131924923	40.04	28.55	27.70	28.00
109	United States History, Survey, Ga. Ed., 2012, Prentice Hall	0132528061	70.40	84.55	No Bid	68.00
110	Glencoe World History, 2012, Glencoe	9780078799945	92.19	99.55	No Bid	82.00
111	Understanding Psychology, 2008, Glencoe	9780078745171	57.36	44.55	19.80	52.00
112	Sociology: The Study of Human Relationships, 2010, Holt	9780544004419	No Bid	42.55	23.70	47.85
113	Psychology, 6 th ed., Worth Publishers	1429244364	77.80	79.95	82.60	82.80
	Payment Terms:					
	Prices quoted firm for one year Y/N		Yes	Yes		Yes
	Delivery		5-10 days	45 days	4-13 days	5-7 days
	Documents Signed Y/N:		Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
	Minority Designation:		Non-Local		Non-Local	Non-Local

Tabulation By: Paige Kriewall

Certified by Joan Carter, CPPB

NUMBER OF BIDS ISSUED: 10 TO MWBE: 1 = A W 1 H M

NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 4 FROM MWBE: 0 = A W H M